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Preface
Abdul Sheriff

The coincidence of two islands in the western Indian Ocean of a similar size in 
terms of area and population, but with different histories of human habitation, 
and more particularly, with a contrasting experience of slavery, provided a unique 
case for comparative history of transition from slavery in Zanzibar and Mauritius. 
While the former is close to the East African coast, and has been settled by humans 
for perhaps as long as thirty centuries, the latter in the middle of the Indian Ocean 
was uninhabited when discovered by the Europeans in the sixteenth century. The 
Europeans came with a system of slavery that was an extension from the familiar 
Atlantic system, although slaves came from a broader range of sources, including 
Asia, Madagascar and  Africa. Zanzibar, on the other hand, had been involved 
in intimate commercial, social and cultural interactions across the Indian Ocean 
for at least two millennia, including slave trade and slavery that was tinged by an 
older slavery tradition influenced by Islam. In the nineteenth century, dependent 
slave systems developed on the islands; but while Zanzibar represented a variant 
of an Indian Ocean slave system, Mauritius represented a variant of the Atlantic 
system – yet both flourished when the world was already under the hegemony of 
the global capitalist mode of production. 

The opportunity was therefore taken by two directors of the Zanzibar Indian 
Ocean Research Institute (ZIORI), Professors Abdul Sheriff and Vijayalakshmi 
Teelock, to initiate a research project on a comparative history of slavery and its 
transition to free labour in the two islands. The research was undertaken primarily 
by two young scholars, Mrs Saada Wahab and Mr Satyendra Peerthum, who 
conducted intensive research in their respective countries, and was coordinated 
by the two directors. The project was kindly funded by the Council for the 
Development of Social Science Research in Africa (CODESRIA). We are 
very grateful to the Executive Secretary of CODESRIA, Dr Ebrima Sall, for 
encouraging us to undertake such a study; to Abdon Kouassivi Sofonnou, for 
following up on our progress with many helpful suggestions; and, finally, to 
Tesfaye Tafesse, for his very pertinent comments which helped us finalise our 
report. The CODESRIA grant enabled us to organise three workshops – the  
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inaugural and final workshops in Zanzibar in December 2011 and April 2012, 
and the mid-term workshop in Mauritius in January 2012, which allowed us to 
work more closely to bring out the comparative aspect of our programme. 

We hope that the comparative study on Mauritius and Zanzibar will prove 
helpful to those involved in comparing the Atlantic experience with that in the 
Indian Ocean for the better understanding of both.
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